WORK SESSION AGENDA

Casper City Council
City Hall, Council Chambers
Tuesday, January 12, 2021, 4:30 p.m.

COVID-19 precautions are in effect at Council meetings. All Council meetings including
Work Sessions are held in Chambers. Entrance to the meetings is the east door off David
Street. Upon entry you will be asked to sign-in for contact tracing purposes. Face coverings
are required. Seating has been gridded into six feet distances. Seating capacity for the
public is fifteen seats. Media will be given priority for seating. Public input via emalil
is encouraged: CouncilComments@casperwy.gov

. . . Allotted | Beginnin
Work Session Meeting Agenda Recommendation | Jinning
Time Time
Recommendations = Information Only, Move Forward for Approval, Direction Requested
1. | Council Meeting Follow-up 5 min 4:30
2. | Council Committee Assignments Direction 20 min 4:35
Requested
3. | Casper 311 Demo Information Only | 20 min 4:55
Casper's Council for People with Disabilities: Direction . .
4 Transportation-Related Initiatives Requested 30 min >:15
5. | Repealing Ordinance for Tobacco Move Forward for 15 min 5:45
Approval
6. | Purchase of Fire Chassis and Body Move Forward for 15 min 6:00
Approval
7 Voluntary Unpaid Leave and Furlough Direction 15 min 6:15
Recompense Requested
8. | Agenda Review 20 min 6:30
9. | Legislative Review 20 min 6:50
10. | Council Around the Table 10 min 7:10

Approximate End Time: 7:20

*Please silence cell phones during the meeting*

We are CASPER
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Efficiency
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December 29, 2020

MEMO TO: J. Carter Napier, City Manager DOS

FROM: Tracey L. Belser, Support Services Director
Michael Szewczyk, IT Manage%

SUBJECT: Casper 311 Citizen Request App
Meeting Type & Date

Council Work Session
January 12, 2021

Action type
None — Informational Only

Recommendation
None

Summary
In 2018. the City entered into an agreement with Tyler Technologies to replace its core enterprise

resource software system. Work Orders and Incident Management are two modules included as part
of the overhaul. Many departments throughout the organization use some type of work order product
to track work performed, labor, materials, etc. Additionally, some receive requests from citizens, for
items such as pot hole repairs, street light outages, and damaged signs. To date, Tyler Work Orders
has been implemented in the Streets, Water, and Fleet divisions.

The Incident Management module serves as a customer relationship application, which integrates with
the Work Order system and enables citizens (and/or staff) to submit requests for service. Currently, as
well with previous systems, individuals performing the work must manually enter the specifics of a
request into a work order. Not only will this product reduce that workload, but will also provide
notification when the task is complete. The Incident Management module, which staff has named
“Casper 3117, is accessible via the City’s website or mobile app titled MyCivic 311.

As an initial rollout, the three specific request types listed above (potholes, signs, and street lights) are
setup for the Streets division. Future growth will occur as more workgroups adopt the new system. A
demonstration of the citizen request component is prepared for Council’s review.

Financial Considerations
None

Oversight/Project Responsibility
Michael Szewczyk, IT Manager

Attachments
None



December 31, 2020

MEMO TO: J. Carter Napier, City Managekj;\]

FROM: Zulima Lopez, Risk Manager and Quality of Life Subcommittee Chair of
Casper’s Council of People with Disabilities (CCPD)

SUBJECT: CCPD Transportation Survey Results and 2021 Initiatives

Meeting Type & Date
Council Work Session, January 12, 2021

Action Type
Direction Requested

Recommendation
That Council provide guidance to the CCPD regarding possible transportation and mobility
improvement projects for 2021.

Summary
Casper’s Council of People with Disabilities has always regarded access to reliable, safe, and

affordable transportation as an essential factor in the quality of life of disabled citizens in our
community. In June 2020, the group launched a survey to solicit feedback from Casper’s disabled
community regarding how they currently utilize transportation, challenges with transportation
access, and options to enhance transportation availability. The survey was delivered through
Survey Monkey and was open for responses from June 1, 2020 to September 12, 2020. Inserts
went out in Casper utility bills in August in an effort to bolster participation in the survey.

Survey results were compiled and reviewed by the membership at the monthly meeting in October.
In early November, the Quality-of-Life subcommittee met to analyze the results further and
identify projects that the CCPD could work on in 2021 to try to enhance transportation availability
for disabled people. These suggested projects were reviewed and approved by the full CCPD
membership at a regular business meeting in November. They are now being presented to the City
Council for feedback.

The CCPD believes that access to transportation involves the ability to reach transportation
sources, such as bus stops and pathways, as well as the ability to access public spaces once people
have arrived at their destination. This can be challenging, particularly for people with physical
disabilities, because of snow and ice-covered sidewalks and crosswalks. The Disability Council is
requesting guidance from the Casper City Council regarding partnerships with City workgroups
and private businesses to improve the winter maintenance of sidewalks and crosswalks so everyone
can enjoy equal access to transportation and amenities, regardless of the weather.



Financial Considerations
Casper’s Council of People with Disabilities utilizes fundraising and events to finance initiatives.
The CCPD is also exploring grant opportunities to help fund projects in 2021.

Oversight/Project Responsibility
Austin Berlin, CCPD Chair, Zulima Lopez, Quality of Life Subcommittee Chair, and all CCPD
membership

Attachments
CCPD Transportation Survey Results and project recommendations for 2021



CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020



CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020
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CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020

What types of transportation do you currently utilize?
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CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020

Qs s  Customize  Saveas™

Transportation (or lack of) impacts my ability to: (check all that apply)
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CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020

Q7 ¢  Customize  Saveas™

If you don’t have enough access to transportation, what types of
transportation would best meet your needs if they were available and
affordable? (check all that apply)
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CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020

Q8 s Customize  Saveasw

What are the barriers to you using transportation? (check all that apply)
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CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020

09 @  Customize  Saveas™

Which of the following solutions would improve transportation in our
community? (check all that apply)
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CCPD Transportation Survey Results
As of 9/18/2020

Q1o s Customize Saveas™
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improve transportation options in our community. (check all that apply)
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Casper’s Council of People with Disabilities (CCPD)
Transportation Survey Results and Recommendations for Transportation Projects

Primary takeaways from the CCPD transportation survey:

e  64% of respondents feel that they don’t have adequate transportation

e 69% of respondents rely primarily on friends/family for transportation

o 84% of respondents feel that lack of transportation limits their ability to get to medical appointments

e 75% of respondents cited limited transportation on weekends and evenings as their biggest challenge

e 50% of respondents feel lack of transportation limits their ability to participate in community events and activities,
shop, and have access to food

e 79% of respondents said a centralized contact regarding transportation options would improve transportation in our
community

o  62% of respondents said helping service providers organize and support transportation for customers would
improve transportation in our community

In response to these findings, the CCPD plans to focus on the following projects in 2021:

1. Continue strong partnership with the Casper Area Metropolitan Planning Organization (MPO) regarding the 5
Year Transit Strategic Development Plan
a. Attend all stakeholder and public meetings to advocate for the disabled community
b. Provide feedback for the project when requested (surveys, workshops, etc.)
c. Invite MPO to periodically attend CCPD meetings to provide updates on the project
2. Pursue expanding ride share (Uber and Lyft) access for people with disabilities
a. Determine if/how many drivers/vehicles within the rideshare networks can accommodate wheelchairs
and other disabilities
b. If not drivers/vehicles, advocate for companies to expand their network; assist in recruiting
c. Research the possibility of a voucher program to discount rides for the disabled
3. Pursue expanding taxi access for people with disabilities
a. Determine if/how many taxi vehicles in the local company fleets can accommodate wheelchairs and
other disabilities
b. If there are no vehicles, advocate for companies to expand their fleets
c. Research the possibility of a voucher program to discount rides for the disabled
4. Facilitate discussions between ride-share companies and medical service providers to introduce rideshare
options for healthcare access
a. Do more research on existing rideshare programs available for healthcare access
b. Examine the possibility of coordinating a webinar to introduce healthcare providers to these programs
and encourage partnerships that benefit disabled clients
5. Develop a list of all transportation resources for disabled people in our community
a. Create a document or web page that lists all of the transportation options and resources for people with
disabilities
b. Include schedules, rates, vehicle equip (such as for wheelchairs), etc.
6. Pursue grants to help fund transportation projects
a. Funds could pay for ride tokens or vouchers, advertising, other transportation project related expenses
b. Few options we already know about:
i. Daniel’s Fund - https://danielsfund.org/grants/overview
ii. Wyoming Governor’s Council on Developmental Disabilities -
https://wgcdd.wyo.gov/projects/mini-grants



https://danielsfund.org/grants/overview
https://wgcdd.wyo.gov/projects/mini-grants

January 6%, 2021

MEMO TO: J. Carter Napier, City Manager {y\)

FROM: Thomas Solberg, Fire Chief
Jason Speiser, Deputy Chief

SUBJECT: Information for the January 19™ Regular Council Meeting, Regarding a
New Fire Chassis and Body Purchase for $628,004.00, Before Trade, for
Use by the Casper Fire-EMS Department

Meeting Type & Date
Work Session; January 12, 2021

Action type

Information only regarding the fire apparatus purchase on the agenda for approval during the
January 19™ regular council meeting.

Recommendation

That Council, by minute action, authorize the purchase of one (1) new fire chassis and body, from
MaxFire Firefighting solutions, Castle Rock, Colorado, for use by the Casper Fire-EMS
Department, in the total amount of $628,004.00, before trade.

Summary

On October 23, 2020, bids were publicly opened for one (1) new fire chassis and body; three (3)
bids were received. Fire Station 3 will use the fire chassis and body, replacing their current fire
chassis and body that is fourteen (14) years old.

The Casper Fire Department has five (5) stations located throughout the city. Each fire station
has one (1) fire chassis and body assigned to them. Fire Station 3 is centrally located on the
corner of 12th and Beverly Street and is currently operating a 2006 American LaFrance fire
engine. The American LaFrance is unit #111173 and has met all criteria needed (age: 14 yrs.,
maintenance costs: $380,136.70, and mileage: 127,399) to be considered for trade.

As required by Wyoming State Statute 15-1-113(b), a bid notice was published in a local
newspaper once a week for a minimum of two (2) consecutive weeks. The bids were as follows:



Vendor Bid Amount  Trade Chassis Prepay Net Cost

Max Fire $628,004.00 $25,000 $10,788 $592.216
Front Range Fire $619,026.00 $5,000 $14,699 $599,327
Mile Hi Fire No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

The recommended purchase of the fire chassis and body from MaxFire, Castle Rock, CO
complies with the intent of all specifications.

Financial Considerations

This purchase was approved in the FY21 adopted budget and is funded by One Cent Funds.

Oversight/Project Responsibility

Dan Coryell, Fleet Manager, will make this purchase with oversight transferred to Jason Speiser,
Deputy Chief of the Casper Fire-EMS Department, after the equipment is received.

Attachments

Engine 3 Information sheet



Casper Fire-EMS Engine 3

2006 American LaFrance Eagle (14 years old): Original Cost $400,000

Mileage:127,399. Engine Hours: 1,958
Lifetime Maintenance Costs: $380,136.70

Pump Hours: 599

New Fire Engine 3
$628,004.00

E3 Trade in $25,000
Chassis Prepay: $10,788
Net Cost: $592,000
Budget FY20: $600,000
Rosenbauer America

General Body Factory in Wyoming,
Minnesota.

Rosenbauer Commander Chassis
with an extruded aluminum body

450 HP Cummins L9 Engine
Allison 3000 EVS Transmission

750 Gallon Tank

Waterous Pump 1500 gpm



January 7, 2021

MEMO TO: His Honor the Mayor and Members of the City Council
J. Carter Napier, City Manager DO\(B

FROM: John Henley, City Attomey% )

SUBJECT: AN ORDINANCE REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 54-00 AS
CODIFIED BY ARTICLE IV, CHAPTER 9.40 OF THE CASPER
MUNICIPAL CODE.

Meeting Type & Date

Work Session
January 12, 2021

Action type

Information

Recommendation

That Council review the attached draft ordinance and prepare follow-up questions and/or
comments as appropriate. The Public Hearing and First Reading of the proposed ordinance is
scheduled for January 19, 2021.

Summary
At the December 1, 2020, Regular Council Meeting, City Council discussed a proposed

ordinance to amend Article IV, Chapter 9.40 of the Casper Municipal Code which if passed,
would have added language to update the Casper Municipal Code and make it consistent with
recent State legislation concerning Wyoming State Statutes §14-3-301 et. segq., effective July 1,
2020, which increased the age of persons able to purchase, possess and use tobacco products
from eighteen (18) years old to twenty-one (21) years old. Council declined to proceed with the
proposed ordinance to update the existing code to coincide with the controlling State legislation
which increased the age for purchase/possession of tobacco products to twenty-one (21) years
old.

The purpose of the attached proposed ordinance is to repeal Article IV of Chapter 9.40 of the
Casper Municipal Code, in order that the City of Casper does not have an Ordinance which
conflicts with State Statutes passed by the legislature.

Financial Considerations
None

Oversight/Project Responsibility
City Attorney’s Office
Casper Police Department

Attachments :
Proposed draft ordinance



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING ORDINANCE NO. 54-00 AS
CODIFIED BY ARTICLE IV, CHAPTER 9.40 OF THE CASPER
MUNICIPAL CODE.

WHEREAS, on December 19, 2000, the City of Casper adopted an Ordinance
titled, “An Ordinance Creating Article IV of Chapter 9.40 of the Casper Municipal Code,
Pertaining to Offenses by or Against Minors” prohibiting the sale of tobacco to persons under
eighteen (18) years old; and,

WHEREAS, effective July 1, 2020, Wyoming Statute §14-3-301 et. seq, prohibit
the sale of nicotine and tobacco products to persons under twenty-one (21) years old and the
purchase, possession and use of tobacco and nicotine products by persons under twenty-one (21)
years old; and,

WHEREAS, the Governing Body of the City of Casper wishes to repeal
Ordinance No. 54-00, in order that the City Code does not conflict with the Wyoming State
Statutes.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF
THE CITY OF CASPER, WYOMING: that Ordinance No. 54-00 titled, “An Ordinance Creating
Article IV of Chapter 9.40 [Sections 9.40.150, 9.40.160, 9.40.170, 9.04.180 and 9.04.190] of the
Casper Municipal Code, Pertaining to Offenses by or Against Minors” is hereby repealed in its
entirety and Article IV of Chapter 9.40 of the Casper Municipal Code is deleted in its entirety.

PASSED on 1% reading the day of ,2021

PASSED on 2™ reading the day of ,2021

PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED on third and final reading the day
of , 2021.
APPROVED AS TO FORM:

CITY OF CASPER, WYOMING
ATTEST: A Municipal Corporation

Fleur Tremel Steven K. Freel
City Clerk Mayor
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